


WESTPORT PUBLIC SCHOOLS

AWARD VENDOR LIST- CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID # 22-013

ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS
CASE / BOX / 

UNIT. ETC
ITEM AWARDED TO BASED ON

1 Clorox Healthcare Hydrogen-Peroxide
Cleaner disinfectant  32 fl. oz spray bottles  9 

bottles per case
CASE

 SAFETY & OCC. 

SUPLIES 
LOW BIDDER

2 Clorox Healthcare Hydrogen-Peroxide
Cleaner disinfectant wipes,  155 wipes per bottle, 

6/ per. case
CASE BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOW BIDDER

3 Clorox Tilex Mildew Rem. Spray Bottles 12 /cs. CASE K&S LOW BIDDER

4 Calcium Magnesium Acetate (Solid CMA) Green Icemelt (40 bags per pallet) SKID NOT AWARDED NOT SPEC. ITEM BID

5 Environmelt Wise Solution Ice Melt 50 lb bag (40 bags per pallet) SKID BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOW BIDDER

6 GoJo Pink Lotion Hand Soap 12/800 ml per case – Equal product or better CASE K&S
SAMPLE PROVIDED-

2ND LOW BIDDER

7 GoJo Lotion Soap Dispenser Push In Handle - White UNITS K&S LOW BIDDER

8 Gum Freeze Gum Remover 12/case. Sample Requested CASE PYRAMID LOW BIDDER

9 M.D. Stetson EPS Stripper
Degreaser, Green Seal, 4 galon/case – Equal or 

better
CASE K&S SPEC. PRODUCT

10 PC 101 Neutral Glass Cleaner Green Seal 4/cs. Equal or Better  CASE K&S
SAMPLE PROVIDED-

SPEC. PRODUCT

11 PC 103 Disinfectant 256 HBV1031- 4/cs., Equal or better CASE K&S
SAMPLE PROVIDED-

SPEC. PRODUCT

12 PC 108 Spray & Wipe Cleaner, equal or better CASE K&S
SAMPLE PROVIDED-

SPEC. PRODUCT

13 PC 120 
Peroxide Multisurface Cleaner, Green seal 4 bottles 

per case, equal or better
CASE K&S

SAMPLE PROVIDED-

SPEC. PRODUCT

14 Prozime #121
Cleaner and Odor Eliminator, Equal or better, 2 

units per case
CASE W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

15 M.D. Stetson Transcend  Floor  Finish Green seal ,  5 gallon plastic container UNITS K&S SPEC. PRODUCT

16 Purell Hand Sanitizer Gel
Disinfectant hand sanitizer, 12.6 fl. Oz bottle, 12 

bottles per case
CASE LOTUS CONNECT LOW BIDDER

17 Sani cloth HB Wipes Germicidal disposable wipe, SKU # Q08472 CASES W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

18 Stainless Steel Cleaner & Polish Wipes
Must have 3

rd
 party green seal or Eco logo,  6 cans 

/ case, 
CASE W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

19 Triple SSS DC Plus Foam Disinfectant Cleaner Cleaner - 12/cs  CASE ALL STAR
QUALITY PRODUCT, 

QT PER CAN

20 Vandalism Mark & Stain Remover Must have Green Seal or Eco Logo,    6-22 oz./cs.    CASE BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOW BIDDER

A. CHEMICAL SUPPLIES
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WESTPORT PUBLIC SCHOOLS

AWARD VENDOR LIST- CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID # 22-013

ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS
CASE / BOX / 

UNIT. ETC
ITEM AWARDED TO BASED ON

21 Angled Brooms Upright Flagged Polystyrene UNITS PYRAMID LOW BIDDER

22 Brooms Rubbermaid Lobby Dust UNITS PYRAMID LOW BIDDER

23 Mop Bucket & Wringer, 
Marked "Wet Floor" on Casters  Rubbermaid or 

Equal
UNITS W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

24 Toilet Bowl Brushes Wood Handle 19' Length Sample Requested UNITS PYRAMID LOW BIDDER

ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS
CASE / BOX / 

UNIT. ETC
ITEM AWARDED TO BASED ON

25 Facial Tissue, Green seal certified
100 tissues / bx, 30 boxes/case  Equal or Better 7.9 

x 7.1 in.
CASE W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

26 Hand Towel Roll , Tork Matic
White hand towel #29 00 89 , 1 ply 700 feet (equal 

), 6/cs
CASE C&C JANITORIAL LOW BIDDER

27 Toilet Tissue, North River, Green seal certified 2 ply Jumbo Rolls, 12/cs. Equal or better CASE K&S LOW BIDDER

ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS
CASE / BOX / 

UNIT. ETC
ITEM AWARDED TO BASED ON

28 3M 3600 Eraser Buff Pads 20 in.or Eq. CASE PYRAMID LOW BIDDER

29 3M or Eq. Scrubbing Pads 20 in. Blue - 20 cs. CASE W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

30 3M Red Speed Pads 20 in. or Eq. CASE W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

31 3M Scrubbing Sponges Better, Scotch Brite, 6 1/4x3 1/2x5/8 CASE PYRAMID LOW BIDDER

32 Bissell-Big Green, 10 Quart Backpack vacuum Model # 37491, with toolkit and attachments UNITS K&S LOW BIDDER

33 Dust Cloths, 18 x 18, 200/cs. Yellow, Ft. Howard or Better - Sample Required CASE K&S LOW BIDDER

34 Emerald Hy-Pro Stripping Floor Pad MDS 20 in. STETCO Equal or better CASE
NEW ENGLAND 

MAINTENANCE 
LOW BIDDER

35 Fort James 9" Jumbo Bath dispenser Bath Tissue Disp. #58250, Equal or Better UNITS C&C JANITORIAL LOW BIDDER

36
Interplast Pitt  Plastics Performance HD Liners, 

30x36 size, 20-30 gallons, 13 Microns

Heavy Strength, 500/pkg, No Box, Shrink Wrap 

Only, 20/25 rolls per case, Item # HR20HHC
CASE W.B. MASON BETTER QUALITY

B. BROOMS, MOPS AND BRUSHES

D. UTILITY ITEMS

C. PAPER PRODUCTS
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WESTPORT PUBLIC SCHOOLS

AWARD VENDOR LIST- CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID # 22-013

37
Interplast Pitt Plastics Performance HD Liners,   

40x46 size, 40-45 gallons, 15 Microns

Extra Heavy,  250/pkg, No Box, Shrink Wrap 

Only, 10/25 rolls per case, Item # HR40XHC
CASE CENTRAL POLY BETTER QUALITY

38
Interplast Pitt Plastics Performance HD Liners, 

38x58 size, 60 gallons, 15 Micron

Extra Heavy, 200 pkg, No Box, Shrink Wrap 

Only, 8/25 rolls per case, Item # HR60XHK -Black 
CASE CENTRAL POLY BETTER QUALITY

39 Probe Back Pack vacuum bags Replacement Vacuum Bags, 10 bags/pack CASE BENMAN INDUSTRIES LOW BIDDER

40 Rubbermaid Brute Dolly 2640-43 Quiet dolly Ref # FG264043 Black UNIT K&S LOW BIDDER

41 Rubbermaid Lobby Dust Pan #2007 UNIT PYRAMID LOW BIDDER

42 Rubbermaid Recycling Container RCP #3536-06 Blue UNIT W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

43 Rubbermaid Tilt Trucks 1/2 cubic yd.
Measurements-56 3/4"L x 28"W x 38 5/8"H, 

Alternate #9T17 
UNIT W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

44 Rubbermaid Trolleys Ref #3551-88 Slim Jim UNIT K&S LOW BIDDER

45 Rubbermaid Wastebaskets 14 qt wastebasket, ref # 2958 or equal UNIT W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

46 Seco High Duster Extension Duster, or Equivalent UNIT K&S LOW BIDDER

47 The Champ One Wipes
Ref # 86884, Heavy DRC wipe, 9"x12" wiper, 225 

wipes per box, 4 boxes per case
CASE W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

48 Triple SSS Back pack vacuum cleaner
Speedster 1000H Commercial HEPA SKU# SSS 

56009
UNIT W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

49 Triple SSS NexGen Microfiber Carpet Bonnets 21 inch, reversible 6 units per case, CASE W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

50 Unger Brute Scraper 4 inch blade UNIT C&C JANITORIAL LOW BIDDER

51 Urinal Screens Deodorizer
100 Active Materials,to contain quats, 12 units per 

case
CASE W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS
CASE / BOX / 

UNIT. ETC
ITEM AWARDED TO BASED ON

52 First Aid Kit, Indoor Emergency kit indoor for up to 25 people KIT K&S LOW BIDDER

53 Nitrile Rubber Gloves 
Rubber Gloves, gloves L size, 200 pieces per/box 

(equal or better)
CASE INTERBORO LOW BIDDER

54 Rubbermaid Mobile Barrier Yellow, flexible panels UNIT W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

55 Rubbermaid Plastic Yellow #6112-Eng./Span., Wet Floor Signs UNIT PYRAMID LOW BIDDER

56 Surgical Gloves 1000 Count, Latex gloves multiple size CASE W.B. MASON LOW BIDDER

57 Surgical Gloves 1000 Count, Vinyl, no powder multiple size. CASE INTERBORO LOW BIDDER

E. SAFETY EQUIPMENT

Page 3 of 3



WESTPORT PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID RESULTS - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID # 22-013

 ALL STAR 

CLEANING 
 APPCO 

 BENMAN 

INDUSTRIES 

 CENTRAL 

POLY 

 C&C 

JANITORIAL  
 INTERBORO  K&S 

 LOTUS 

CONNECT 

 NEW ENGLAND 

MAINTENANCE 
 NEXTGEN  PYRAMID  

 SAFETY & OCC. 

SUPLIES 
 WB MASON 

ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES
CASE / BOX / 

UNIT. ETC
BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE

1 Clorox Healthcare Hydrogen-Peroxide Cleaner disinfectant  32 fl. oz spray bottles  9 bottles per case SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE 138.78$              NO BID 56.44$                NO BID 73.29$                NO BID NO BID 61.19$                60.00$                59.84$                NO BID 45.50$                62.67$                

2 Clorox Healthcare Hydrogen-Peroxide Cleaner disinfectant wipes,  155 wipes per bottle, 6/ per. case SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE 47.27$                NO BID 39.48$                NO BID 51.27$                NO BID 40.38$                44.75$                42.00$                39.65$                NO BID 39.50$                43.57$                

3 Clorox Tilex Mildew Rem. Spray Bottles 12 /cs. SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE 58.08$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 61.56$                NO BID 48.00$                56.19$                52.00$                51.00$                NO BID 71.50$                50.42$                

4 Calcium Magnesium Acetate (Solid CMA) Green Icemelt (40 bags per pallet) NO SUBSTITUTION SKID NO BID NO BID 578.00$              NO BID 618.00$              NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 556.00$              505.19$              

5 Environmelt Wise Solution Ice Melt 50 lb bag (40 bags per pallet) SAMPLE REQUIRED SKID NO BID NO BID 497.00$              NO BID 618.00$              NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 556.00$              505.19$              

6 GoJo Pink Lotion Hand Soap 12/800 ml per case – Equal product or better SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID 38.04$                NO BID 39.02$                NO BID 31.95$                52.13$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.25$                29.30$                

7 GoJo Lotion Soap Dispenser Push In Handle - White UNITS 15.57$                NO BID 13.61$                NO BID 25.04$                NO BID 3.00$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.75$                18.63$                

8 Gum Freeze Gum Remover 12/case. Sample Requested SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE 61.11$                NO BID 36.79$                NO BID 66.62$                NO BID 60.95$                NO BID NO BID 73.86$                30.98$                60.79$                53.02$                

9 M.D. Stetson EPS Stripper Degreaser, Green Seal, 4 galon/case – Equal or better SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID 59.25$                NO BID 83.15$                NO BID 82.15$                NO BID NO BID 161.72$              NO BID 22.25$                42.86$                

10 PC 101 Neutral Glass Cleaner Green Seal 4/cs. Equal or Better  SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID 63.07$                NO BID 73.08$                NO BID 58.85$                NO BID NO BID 122.47$              NO BID 20.95$                90.14$                

11 PC 103 Disinfectant 256 HBV1031- 4/cs., Equal or better SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 53.98$                NO BID 45.15$                NO BID NO BID 307.63$              NO BID 29.50$                84.19$                

12 PC 108 Spray & Wipe Cleaner, equal or better SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 96.98$                NO BID 53.30$                NO BID NO BID 152.61$              NO BID 75.00$                74.26$                

13 PC 120 Peroxide Multisurface Cleaner, Green seal 4 bottles per case, equal or better SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 80.71$                NO BID 75.65$                NO BID NO BID 109.85$              NO BID 39.50$                100.97$              

14 Prozime #121 Cleaner and Odor Eliminator, Equal or better, 2 units per case SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 63.50$                NO BID NO BID 80.56$                NO BID NO BID 50.49$                

15 M.D. Stetson Transcend  Floor  Finish Green seal ,  5 gallon plastic container SAMPLE REQUIRED UNITS 97.00$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 76.16$                NO BID 91.96$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.50$                78.22$                

16 Purell Hand Sanitizer Gel Disinfectant hand sanitizer, 12.6 fl. Oz bottle, 12 bottles per case CASE 75.00$                NO BID 55.90$                NO BID 67.99$                NO BID NO BID 36.00$                NO BID NO BID 59.98$                45.29$                40.47$                

17 Sani cloth HB Wipes Germicidal disposable wipe, SKU # Q08472 SAMPLE REQUIRED CASES NO BID NO BID 67.60$                NO BID 71.77$                NO BID 112.50$              86.36$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.46$                

18 Stainless Steel Cleaner & Polish Wipes Must have 3
rd

 party green seal or Eco logo,  6 cans / case, CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 58.60$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 56.98$                NO BID 40.11$                

19 Triple SSS DC Plus Foam Disinfectant Cleaner Cleaner - 12/cs  SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE 44.77$                NO BID 42.29$                NO BID 53.40$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 41.53$                

20 Vandalism Mark & Stain Remover Must have Green Seal or Eco Logo,    6-22 oz./cs.    SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID 51.35$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 97.50$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 65.75$                106.84$              

 ALL STAR 

CLEANING 
 APPCO 

 BENMAN 

INDUSTRIES 

 CENTRAL 

POLY 

 C&C 

JANITORIAL  
 INTERBORO  K&S 

 LOTUS 

CONNECT 

 NEW ENGLAND 

MAINTENANCE 
 NEXTGEN  PYRAMID  

 SAFETY & OCC. 

SUPLIES 
 WB MASON 

ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES
CASE / BOX / 

UNIT. ETC
BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE

21 Angled Brooms Upright Flagged Polystyrene UNITS 7.50$                  NO BID 6.42$                  NO BID 5.30$                  NO BID 5.88$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID 59.88$                11.59$                5.26$                  

22 Brooms Rubbermaid Lobby Dust UNITS 4.73$                  NO BID 8.50$                  NO BID 12.75$                NO BID 6.25$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID 47.76$                11.25$                4.03$                  

23 Mop Bucket & Wringer, Marked "Wet Floor" on Casters  Rubbermaid or Equal UNITS 78.30$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 139.64$              NO BID 63.50$                NO BID 110.00$              NO BID 61.99$                65.50$                60.93$                

24 Toilet Bowl Brushes Wood Handle 19' Length Sample Requested UNITS 3.50$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.88$                  NO BID 3.50$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.48$                9.90$                  1.30$                  

 ALL STAR 

CLEANING 
 APPCO 

 BENMAN 

INDUSTRIES 

 CENTRAL 

POLY 

 C&C 

JANITORIAL  
 INTERBORO  K&S 

 LOTUS 

CONNECT 

 NEW ENGLAND 

MAINTENANCE 
 NEXTGEN  PYRAMID  

 SAFETY & OCC. 

SUPLIES 
 WB MASON 

ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES
CASE / BOX / 

UNIT. ETC
BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE

25 Facial Tissue, Green seal certified 100 tissues / bx, 30 boxes/case  Equal or Better 7.9 x 7.1 in. SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID 17.89$                NO BID 21.11$                20.91$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 29.98$                25.50$                16.60$                

26 Hand Towel Roll , Tork Matic White hand towel #29 00 89 , 1 ply 700 feet (equal ), 6/cs CASE 64.81$                NO BID 59.28$                NO BID 44.43$                NO BID 70.51$                NO BID NO BID 52.93$                NO BID 54.10$                47.26$                

27 Toilet Tissue, North River, Green seal certified 2 ply Jumbo Rolls, 12/cs. Equal or better SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE 35.00$                27.47$                42.00$                24.10$                34.94$                NO BID 19.97$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.50$                17.98$                

C. PAPER PRODUCTS

B. BROOMS, MOPS AND BRUSHES

A. CHEMICAL SUPPLIES
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WESTPORT PUBLIC SCHOOLS

BID RESULTS - CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES BID # 22-013

 ALL STAR 

CLEANING 
 APPCO 

 BENMAN 

INDUSTRIES 

 CENTRAL 

POLY 

 C&C 

JANITORIAL  
 INTERBORO  K&S 

 LOTUS 

CONNECT 

 NEW ENGLAND 

MAINTENANCE 
 NEXTGEN  PYRAMID  

 SAFETY & OCC. 

SUPLIES 
 WB MASON 

ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES
CASE / BOX / 

UNIT. ETC
BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE

28 3M 3600 Eraser Buff Pads 20 in.or Eq. CASE 25.00$                NO BID 42.05$                NO BID 30.54$                NO BID 16.27$                NO BID 14.55$                NO BID 12.89$                21.50$                13.10$                

29 3M or Eq. Scrubbing Pads 20 in. Blue - 20 cs. CASE 24.53$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 26.67$                NO BID 16.27$                NO BID 14.00$                NO BID 12.89$                21.50$                12.29$                

30 3M Red Speed Pads 20 in. or Eq. CASE 24.53$                NO BID 19.66$                NO BID 26.67$                NO BID 16.27$                NO BID 14.00$                NO BID 12.89$                21.50$                12.29$                

31 3M Scrubbing Sponges Better, Scotch Brite, 6 1/4x3 1/2x5/8 CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 33.26$                NO BID 30.23$                NO BID 31.75$                NO BID 12.75$                NO BID 24.19$                

32 Bissell-Big Green, 10 Quart Backpack vacuum Model # 37491, with toolkit and attachments UNITS 472.13$              NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 255.00$              NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 312.72$              

33 Dust Cloths, 18 x 18, 200/cs. Yellow, Ft. Howard or Better - Sample Required CASE 38.74$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 66.15$                NO BID 28.20$                NO BID 50.00$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.40$                

34 Emerald Hy-Pro Stripping Floor Pad MDS 20 in. STETCO Equal or better SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE 53.93$                NO BID 19.86$                NO BID 51.21$                NO BID 18.00$                NO BID 15.50$                39.90$                16.99$                NO BID 16.36$                

35 Fort James 9" Jumbo Bath dispenser Bath Tissue Disp. #58250, Equal or Better UNITS 40.50$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 14.93$                NO BID 28.80$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.95$                27.90$                

36
Interplast Pitt  Plastics Performance HD Liners, 

30x36 size, 20-30 gallons, 13 Microns

Heavy Strength, 500/pkg, No Box, Shrink Wrap Only, 20/25 rolls per case, 

Item # HR20HHC
SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 34.30$                NO BID 36.82$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 30.50$                36.18$                

37
Interplast Pitt Plastics Performance HD Liners,   

40x46 size, 40-45 gallons, 15 Microns

Extra Heavy,  250/pkg, No Box, Shrink Wrap Only, 10/25 rolls per case, 

Item # HR40XHC
SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 33.83$                NO BID 35.82$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 35.75$                35.59$                

38
Interplast Pitt Plastics Performance HD Liners, 

38x58 size, 60 gallons, 15 Micron

Extra Heavy, 200 pkg, No Box, Shrink Wrap Only, 8/25 rolls per case, Item 

# HR60XHK -Black Only
SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID 32.75$                NO BID 34.72$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 45.50$                34.26$                

39 Probe Back Pack vacuum bags Replacement Vacuum Bags, 10 bags/pack CASE 93.78$                NO BID 21.24$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 98.83$                

40 Rubbermaid Brute Dolly 2640-43 Quiet dolly Ref # FG264043 Black UNIT 103.29$              NO BID 71.46$                NO BID 122.83$              NO BID 29.50$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 40.99$                110.41$              39.46$                

41 Rubbermaid Lobby Dust Pan #2007 UNIT 10.13$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.72$                  NO BID 25.50$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.19$                  15.90$                8.22$                  

42 Rubbermaid Recycling Container RCP #3536-06 Blue UNIT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 80.30$                46.89$                

43 Rubbermaid Tilt Trucks 1/2 cubic yd. Measurements-56 3/4"L x 28"W x 38 5/8"H, Alternate #9T17 UNIT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 557.13$              NO BID 490.00$              NO BID NO BID NO BID 499.98$              510.00$              329.12$              

44 Rubbermaid Trolleys Ref #3551-88 Slim Jim UNIT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 117.36$              NO BID 45.46$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 80.00$                

45 Rubbermaid Wastebaskets 14 qt wastebasket, ref # 2958 or equal UNIT NO BID NO BID 8.98$                  NO BID 10.08$                NO BID 5.90$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.89$                  NO BID 3.81$                  

46 Seco High Duster Extension Duster, or Equivalent UNIT 10.80$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 39.36$                NO BID 7.50$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.99$                20.29$                9.73$                  

47 The Champ One Wipes
Ref # 86884, Heavy DRC wipe, 9"x12" wiper, 225 wipes per box, 4 boxes 

per case
SAMPLE REQUIRED CASE 72.31$                NO BID 62.88$                NO BID 53.98$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 56.00$                NO BID 59.98$                NO BID 44.14$                

48 Triple SSS Back pack vacuum cleaner Speedster 1000H Commercial HEPA SKU# SSS 56009 UNIT 472.13$              NO BID 477.00$              NO BID 613.76$              NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 312.72$              

49 Triple SSS NexGen Microfiber Carpet Bonnets 21 inch, reversible 6 units per case, CASE 72.00$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 142.73$              NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 140.00$              

50 Unger Brute Scraper 4 inch blade UNIT 33.21$                NO BID 19.15$                NO BID 14.08$                NO BID 15.98$                NO BID NO BID NO BID 21.98$                15.29$                21.16$                

51 Urinal Screens Deodorizer 100 Active Materials,to contain quats, 12 units per case CASE 112.29$              NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.86$                NO BID 30.20$                NO BID 18.50$                NO BID 11.88$                25.50$                11.00$                

 ALL STAR 

CLEANING 
 APPCO 

 BENMAN 

INDUSTRIES 

 CENTRAL 

POLY 

 C&C 

JANITORIAL  
 INTERBORO  K&S 

 LOTUS 

CONNECT 

 NEW ENGLAND 

MAINTENANCE 
 NEXTGEN  PYRAMID  

 SAFETY & OCC. 

SUPLIES 
 WB MASON 

ITEM PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS NOTES
CASE / BOX / 

UNIT. ETC
BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE

52 First Aid Kit, Indoor Emergency kit indoor for up to 25 people KIT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 59.18$                NO BID 19.25$                29.99$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 48.49$                

53 Nitrile Rubber Gloves Rubber Gloves, gloves L size, 200 pieces per/box (equal or better) CASE 128.00$              NO BID NO BID NO BID 130.46$              42.00$                63.50$                147.00$              NO BID NO BID 99.90$                NO BID 9.11$                  

54 Rubbermaid Mobile Barrier Yellow, flexible panels UNIT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 444.54$              76.00$                NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 329.98$              NO BID 297.68$              

55 Rubbermaid Plastic Yellow #6112-Eng./Span., Wet Floor Signs UNIT 9.79$                  NO BID 19.60$                NO BID 23.03$                NO BID 7.88$                  NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.99$                  NO BID 7.34$                  

56 Surgical Gloves 1000 Count, Latex gloves multiple size CASE 89.50$                NO BID 81.60$                NO BID 43.47$                NO BID 68.75$                95.00$                NO BID NO BID 69.90$                NO BID 61.11$                

57 Surgical Gloves 1000 Count, Vinyl, no powder multiple size. CASE 105.40$              39.97$                NO BID NO BID 52.27$                27.00$                36.50$                95.00$                NO BID NO BID 49.90$                NO BID 30.56$                

E. SAFETY EQUIPMENT

D. UTILITY ITEMS
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