UNIFORMS BID #16-013-BOE

		UNIT ONING DID #10-013-DOE		
has Description		JULY 1, 2016 - JUNE 30, 2017		
em Description	FEURY IMAGE	MAG & SONS *	CCP	ARAMARK**
#	GROUP	CLOTHING	INDUSTRIES	UNIFORM
1 LONG SLEEVE WORK SHIRT				
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	\$18.90	\$12.80/\$14.74	\$17.50	\$13.99/\$14.99
2 SHORT SLEEVE WORK SHIRT	\$16.89	\$11.20/\$12.81	\$16.25	\$12.99/\$13.99
3 WORK PANTS	\$17.42	\$12.70/\$15.89	\$18.25	\$14.99/\$15.99
4 POLO SHIRT	\$23.92	\$8.99/\$13.78	\$13.95	\$15.99/\$16.99
5 SWEATSHIRT	\$18.79	\$9.85/\$11.92	\$15.50	\$27.99/\$32.99
6 RAIN GEAR	\$12.35	\$11.65/\$12.50	\$33.75	\$21.99/\$25.99
7 RUBBER BOOTS	\$18.67	\$15.60	\$15.75	\$19.99
8 HOODED SWEATSHIRT	\$24.07	\$12.45/\$16.23	\$19.75	\$25.99/\$29.99
9 WINTER COATS LONG	\$104.74	\$54.76/\$64.70	\$39.95	\$65.24/\$72.74
10 WINTER COATS SHORT	\$43.70	\$37.94/\$43.00	\$33.75	\$57.74/\$65.24
11 TURTLE NECK LONG SLEEVE	\$22.77	\$15.06/\$16.45	\$13.25	No Bid
12 T SHIRTS	\$16.29	\$8.26/\$11.10	\$5.75	\$7.99/\$8.99
13 HATS	\$3.27	\$3.50/\$5.50	\$3.75	\$9.99
14 GLOVES	\$23.87	\$4.00	\$4.99	\$14.99
15 WORK BOOTS	\$77.33	\$34.00/\$35.00	\$42.50	\$92.24
	JULY 1,	2017 - JUNE 30, 2018		
em Description	FEURY IMAGE	MAG & SONS *	CCP	ARAMARK**
# .	GROUP	CLOTHING	INDUSTRIES	UNIFORM
1 LONG SLEEVE WORK SHIRT	\$19.46	\$12.80/\$14.74	\$17.50	\$13.99/\$14.99
2 SHORT SLEEVE WORK SHIRT	\$17.40	\$11.20/\$12.81	\$16.25	\$12.99/\$13.99
3 WORK PANTS				
4 POLO SHIRT	\$17.94	\$12.70/\$15.89	\$18,25	\$14,99/\$15,99
	\$17.94 \$24.63	\$12.70/\$15.89 \$8.99/\$13.78	\$18.25 \$13.95	\$14.99/\$15.99 \$15.99/\$16.99
5 SWEATSHIRT			<u> </u>	\$15.99/\$16.99
5 SWEATSHIRT 6 RAIN GEAR	\$24.63	\$8.99/\$13.78	\$13.95	\$15.99/\$16.99 \$27.99/\$32.99
6 RAIN GEAR 7 RUBBER BOOTS	\$24.63 \$19.35	\$8.99/\$13.78 \$9.85/\$11.92	\$13.95 \$15.50	\$15.99/\$16.99
6 RAIN GEAR	\$24.63 \$19.35 \$12.72	\$8.99/\$13.78 \$9.85/\$11.92 \$11.65/\$12.50	\$13.95 \$15.50 \$33.75	\$15.99/\$16.99 \$27.99/\$32.99 \$21.99/\$25.99 \$19.99
6 RAIN GEAR 7 RUBBER BOOTS	\$24.63 \$19.35 \$12.72 \$19.23	\$8.99/\$13.78 \$9.85/\$11.92 \$11.65/\$12.50 \$15.60 \$12.45/\$16.23	\$13.95 \$15.50 \$33.75 \$15.75 \$19.75	\$15.99/\$16.99 \$27.99/\$32.99 \$21.99/\$25.99 \$19.99 \$25.99/\$29.99
6 RAIN GEAR 7 RUBBER BOOTS 8 HOODED SWEATSHIRT	\$24.63 \$19.35 \$12.72 \$19.23 \$24.79	\$8.99/\$13.78 \$9.85/\$11.92 \$11.65/\$12.50 \$15.60	\$13.95 \$15.50 \$33.75 \$15.75	\$15.99/\$16.99 \$27.99/\$32.99 \$21.99/\$25.99 \$19.99 \$25.99/\$29.99 \$65.24/\$72.74
6 RAIN GEAR 7 RUBBER BOOTS 8 HOODED SWEATSHIRT 9 WINTER COATS LONG	\$24.63 \$19.35 \$12.72 \$19.23 \$24.79 \$107.88	\$8.99/\$13.78 \$9.85/\$11.92 \$11.65/\$12.50 \$15.60 \$12.45/\$16.23 \$54.76/\$64.70	\$13.95 \$15.50 \$33.75 \$15.75 \$19.75 \$39.95 \$33.75	\$15.99/\$16.99 \$27.99/\$32.99 \$21.99/\$25.99 \$19.99 \$25.99/\$29.99 \$65.24/\$72.74 \$57.74/\$65.24
6 RAIN GEAR 7 RUBBER BOOTS 8 HOODED SWEATSHIRT 9 WINTER COATS LONG 10 WINTER COATS SHORT	\$24.63 \$19.35 \$12.72 \$19.23 \$24.79 \$107.88 \$45.01	\$8.99/\$13.78 \$9.85/\$11.92 \$11.65/\$12.50 \$15.60 \$12.45/\$16.23 \$54.76/\$64.70 \$37.94/\$43.00	\$13.95 \$15.50 \$33.75 \$15.75 \$19.75 \$39.95 \$33.75 \$13.25	\$15.99/\$16.99 \$27.99/\$32.99 \$21.99/\$25.99 \$19.99 \$25.99/\$29.99 \$65.24/\$72.74 \$57.74/\$65.24 No Bid
6 RAIN GEAR 7 RUBBER BOOTS 8 HOODED SWEATSHIRT 9 WINTER COATS LONG 10 WINTER COATS SHORT 11 TURTLE NECK LONG SLEEVE	\$24.63 \$19.35 \$12.72 \$19.23 \$24.79 \$107.88 \$45.01 \$23.45 \$16.78	\$8.99/\$13.78 \$9.85/\$11.92 \$11.65/\$12.50 \$15.60 \$12.45/\$16.23 \$54.76/\$64.70 \$37.94/\$43.00 \$15.06/\$16.45 \$8.26/\$11.10	\$13.95 \$15.50 \$33.75 \$15.75 \$19.75 \$39.95 \$33.75 \$13.25 \$5.75	\$15.99/\$16.99 \$27.99/\$32.99 \$21.99/\$25.99 \$19.99 \$25.99/\$29.99 \$65.24/\$72.74 \$57.74/\$65.24 No Bid \$7.99/\$8.99
6 RAIN GEAR 7 RUBBER BOOTS 8 HOODED SWEATSHIRT 9 WINTER COATS LONG 10 WINTER COATS SHORT 11 TURTLE NECK LONG SLEEVE 12 T SHIRTS	\$24.63 \$19.35 \$12.72 \$19.23 \$24.79 \$107.88 \$45.01 \$23.45	\$8.99/\$13.78 \$9.85/\$11.92 \$11.65/\$12.50 \$15.60 \$12.45/\$16.23 \$54.76/\$64.70 \$37.94/\$43.00 \$15.06/\$16.45	\$13.95 \$15.50 \$33.75 \$15.75 \$19.75 \$39.95 \$33.75 \$13.25	\$15.99/\$16.99 \$27.99/\$32.99 \$21.99/\$25.99 \$19.99 \$25.99/\$29.99 \$65.24/\$72.74 \$57.74/\$65.24 No Bid

UNIFORMS BID #16-013-BOE

Item Description	FEURY IMAGE	MAG & SONS *	CCP	ARAMARK**
#	GROUP	CLOTHING	INDUSTRIES	UNIFORM
	JULY 1	, 2018 - JUNE 30, 2019		
1 LONG SLEEVE WORK SHIRT	\$20.05	\$12.80/\$14.74	\$17.50	\$14.99/\$15.99
2 SHORT SLEEVE WORK SHIRT	\$17.92	\$11.20/\$12.81	\$16.25	\$13.99/\$14.99
3 WORK PANTS	\$18.48	\$12.70/\$15.89	\$18.25	\$15.99/\$16.99
4 POLO SHIRT	\$25.37	\$8.99/\$13.78	\$13.95	\$16.99/\$17.99
5 SWEATSHIRT	\$19.93	\$9.85/\$11.92	\$15.50	\$28.99/\$33.99
6 RAIN GEAR	\$13.10	\$11.65/\$12.50	\$33.75	\$22.99/\$26.99
7 RUBBER BOOTS	\$19.80	\$15.60	\$15.75	\$20.99
8 HOODED SWEATSHIRT	\$25.53	\$12.45/\$16.23	\$19.75	\$26.99/\$30.99
9 WINTER COATS LONG	\$111.12	\$54.76/\$64.70	\$39.95	\$66.24/\$73.74
10 WINTER COATS SHORT	\$46.36	\$37.94/\$43.00	\$33.75	\$58.99/\$66.99
11 TURTLE NECK LONG SLEEVE	\$24.15	\$15.06/\$16.45	\$13.25	No Bid
12 T SHIRTS	\$17.29	\$8.26/\$11.10	\$5.75	\$8.99/\$9.99
13 HATS	\$3.47	\$3.50/\$5.50	\$3.75	\$10.99
14 GLOVES	\$25.32	\$4.00	\$4.99	\$15.99
15 WORK BOOTS	\$82.04	\$34.00/\$35.00	\$42.50	\$94.99
SAMPLES REQUIRED				
* Mag & Son was terminated by the BOE due to inferior quality and service.				
** Aramark did not bid on Item 11. This would	disqualify them.			