INTEROFFICE MEMORANDUM

TO: ELIO LONGO

FROM: " NATALIE CARRIGNAN

SUBJECT: BID RESULTS FOR BID #18-013-BOFE,

DATE: 5/14/2018 \ \K

\1) ‘

CC: CC NAME S

Below are the bid results for bid #18-013-BOE for the purchase of HP Chromeb&oks. I

recommend awarding line item #1 and add alt items #1 and 3 to PCMG. They were the lowest

responsible bidder. We will not be awarding the other items; we choose to go with the 4 GB

RAM option. Please contact me with questions.
Vendor/Extended Pricing Item 1 Item 2 Alt1 Alt2 Alt3 Alt4
CDWG $32,000.00 NoBid | § 6,400.00 No Bid 6,400.00 No Bid
HyperTech Direct $41,868.75 $ 32,493.75 | $ 8373.75 | $ 6,498.75 8,373.75 |'$ 7,398.75
OM Office Supplies Inc $34,668.75 $ 42,187.50 | $ 6,933.75 | $ 8,437.50 6,933.75 | § 8,437.50
PCMG, Inc. $31,000.00 $ 40,500.00 | $ 6,200.00 | $ 8,100.00 6,200.00 | § 8,100.00
SAISystems $46,875.00 $ 48,750.00 | $10,250.00 | $10,825.00 10,625.00 | $§ 11,900.00
WB Mason NoBid | $§ 40,266.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zones, Inc $42,807.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




