
CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES

BID#16-010-BOE

Item Description M.D. Genesis II Pyramid Interboro Benman E-Z Way CCP W.B. Dumouchel Tronex K & S Unipak Rovic I-Ric Central N.E. All Calico

# Stetson Inc. School Packaging Industries Products Industries Mason Paper International Distrib. Poly Maint. Star

1 M.D. Stetson $18,480.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $20,720.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $89,110.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18,471.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Transsend Green Seal Universal NCL Simoniz Hillyard

Fl. Finish - 1400 Gal., NO SUBS Evergreen 1400 Pails

2 Enhancer Spray $600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $388.80 $329.20 No Bid $353.30 No Bid No Bid $271.10 No Bid $853.20 $349.50 No Bid No Bid $378.80 No Bid

Buff 12 Qt. Enhancer Spit NCL BK0519-12 Hillyard Sun Glo Husky

10 cs. Shine

3 M.D. Stetson EPS Stripper $40,280.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $20,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $28,570.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

& Degreaser Green Seal NCL Green Simoniz Hillyard

500 Cases, NO SUBS Impact 500 Pails

4 Dupal #58 Lotion Soap, Unscented No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12,850.00 $8,937.50 No Bid No Bid $7,631.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Green Seal - 800 mil. Kytol NCL Simoniz Hillyard

275 Cases Green Seal

5 N.E. Maint. Depot Eco No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,375.80 $8,065.50 No Bid No Bid $631.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,309.20 No Bid No Bid $8,265.00 No Bid No Bid

Wet Mops Equal or Better SSS Wilen 95 Units Hillyard

95 Cases Eline

6 GoJo Lotion Soap No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $444.80 No Bid $1,248.00 No Bid $376.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Charge $1,160.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Disp.- Push In SSS CS-PD w/purchase

Handle - 80 units Item #4

7 Toilet Tissue 2 Ply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29,775.00 $28,200.00 $21,375.00 No Bid $23,250.00 No Bid $37,050.00 No Bid $30,750.00 $20,250.00 No Bid No Bid

North River Green Seal Only Jen 202 Atlas Green NR-4047 TT1125 SCA Atlas

Eq. or Better - 1500 Cases Heritage

8 North River Green Seal Certified No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $37,920.00 $29,680.00 $43,920.00 $29,728.00 $25,184.00 No Bid $24,800.00 No Bid $28,240.00 No Bid $23,680.00 $24,800.00 No Bid No Bid

Roll Towels-Eq. or Better BW460 GP26401 Boardwalk CDS 1313 NR-1313A PT350 SCA Putrey

1600 cs. Green Seal $6,252.00 Cascades

9 Facial Tissue - 100/bx. No Bid No Bid $2,996.00 No Bid No Bid $3,172.00 $3,450.00 $3,790.00 $2,900.00 No Bid $2,700.00 No Bid $3,530.00 $2,802.00 $2,700.00 $2,150.00 No Bid No Bid

200 Cases General GP47410 Jen 6501 Green Seal NR-4082 FT2930 Bay West

Eq.or Better 9.25 x 8.25 Paper Cascades Not Green Seal

10 Interplast Pitt Plastics Perf. HD Liners $32,704.00 No Bid No Bid $26,796.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16,100.00 No Bid No Bid $24,220.00 $33,152.00 No Bid $23,520.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

HHC 30x36, 13 Microns, 20-30 Gal. Pitt/Inteplast AP-H0303713N Natural

Shrink Wrap Only, NO SUBS. Berry

Sample Required, 1400 cs. 30 x 37

11 Interplast Pitt Plastics Perf. HD Liners $27,516.00 No Bid No Bid $22,608.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24,000.00 No Bid No Bid $21,600.00 $25,320.00 No Bid $21,480.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

HR40xHC, 15 Microns, 250/pkg. Pitt/Inteplast AP-404816NSR Natural

40X46, Extra Heavy, NO SUBS. Berry

Shrink Wrap Only, NO SUBS., Sample, 1200 cs. 40 x 48

12 Interplast Pitt Plastics Perf. HD Liners $3,313.50 No Bid No Bid $3,051.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,187.50 No Bid No Bid $2,850.00 $3,826.50 No Bid $2,625.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

60 Gal., Extra Heavy, 38x58 Black Only Pitt/Inteplast AP-M03860NSR Berry 

HCxL6017, Sample Required Black

Shrink Wrap Only, NO SUBS., 150 cs. 38 x 60

13 E Z Way Prod. Environ. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Green Seal Ice Melt

NO SUBS. - 350 Bags

14 Gum Freeze Remover No Bid $239.80 $229.80 No Bid $297.60 No Bid $537.50 $321.20 $439.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,694.40 $515.00 No Bid $320.00 $400.80 No Bid

12/Cs. Sample Req. Chase Chase SSS Boardwalk Boardwalk Simoniz Hillyard Franklin Simonize

10 cs. 353-A Crisp

15 Bissell Back Pack Vacs - Big Green No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,232.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,016.00 No Bid $5,497.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,336.00 No Bid

10 qt. w/tool kit attachments #37491 - 16 un. Mosquito EP-PB1001 Tennant

C:\Users\loan\Downloads\cust16

5/9/2016

9:54 PM 1



CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES

BID#16-010-BOE

Item Description M.D. Genesis II Pyramid Interboro Benman E-Z Way CCP W.B. Dumouchel Tronex K & S Unipak Rovic I-Ric Central N.E. All Calico

# Stetson Inc. School Packaging Industries Products Industries Mason Paper International Distrib. Poly Maint. Star

16 Dust Cloths, 18 x 18 No Bid No Bid $3,747.00 No Bid $8,310.00 $3,097.00 No Bid $5,949.00 $8,992.50 No Bid $1,725.00 No Bid $39,600.00 No Bid No Bid $3,600.00 $5,763.00 No Bid

Yellow, Ft. Howard or MDI 78403-200 17 x 14 #78409 Chicopee MD-78403 DW79102-2 Hillyard

Better - Sample 150 cs. Classic

17 Cotton Boss Work Gloves No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.00 No Bid $57.00 No Bid $112.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sample Requested Memphis

50 prs. 8100 C

18 Toilet Bowl Brushes No Bid No Bid $46.50 No Bid $115.00 $173.50 No Bid $115.50 $112.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $476.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $106.50 $36.00

Wood Handle 19' Length ABCO CI-2-363300 Rubbermaid RB-6301 Unger Rubbermaid

Sample Req. 50 br. #BH18001

19 Shazame Degreaser Bio Enzyme Cleaner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $436.80 $528.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $450.00 No Bid $466.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

NO SUBSTITUTIONS Shazame BK1830-4 Hillyard

10 cs.

20 Neoprem Gloves Long No Bid No Bid $25.00 No Bid $150.00 No Bid $310.00 No Bid $27.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $68.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.80

Sleeve XL - Sample Req. Tradex 15" Superior NE SZ-GRFO-XL Impact Safety

20 prs. 246FFL Zone

21 Latex, Extra Lg. No Bid $3,723.00 $3,490.00 No Bid $2,860.00 $3,665.00 $2,945.00 $2,645.00 $3,470.00 $1,970.00 No Bid $2,850.00 $10,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,994.00

Surgical Gloves Genesis Tradex GRER-XL-1 Pro Works Crystalware SZ-GRPR-XL 240 cs. Safety

24/cs. -100 cs. - Sample GL-LI06FX Zone

22 Quest-Magician No Bid No Bid $336.96 No Bid $582.40 $568.10 $388.70 $807.56 $627.90 No Bid $597.22 No Bid $1,060.80 $1,125.00 No Bid $624.00 $365.30 No Bid

Stain Removing Sponge Hydra Magic Maxiclean X Punge Proctor & Magic BK43516 Impact ? Mighty Americo

24/cs. - 26 cs. Eraser Gamble Eraser 30 cs. Sponge

23 Extension Cords 50 ft. No Bid No Bid $629.70 No Bid $867.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $538.50 No Bid No Bid $930.00 No Bid No Bid $478.20 No Bid

50 ft. 14/3 Colemans Woods EP1007 Nationwide

30 un. Lighted End

24 E Z Way Flop Dust Mop System No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,766.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $837.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

NO SUBSTITUTIONS FM-48-K Filmop

34 Pieces

25 Vandalism Mark & Stain No Bid $184.72 No Bid No Bid $195.92 $352.00 $134.50 $170.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $113.76 $300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Remover - 12/cs w/3rd Party Green Seal Chase MTS 40901 Soy Boardwalk Motsenbockers Hillyard

or Eco Logo Sample Req. - 4 cs. Queen 351-A

26 NCL Foam Break - 4 gals. Per case No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $392.80 $448.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $403.70 No Bid $813.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

NO SUBSTITUTIONS Foam BK0650-4 Hillyard

10 cs. Break

27 Kabloohey Restroom $2,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,502.80 No Bid $2,816.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,956.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,185.60 No Bid

Cleaner NO SUBS 4-1 GAL/CT Hillyard

40 cs.

28 Urinal Screens Non Para No Bid $329.40 $299.40 No Bid $316.80 $428.40 No Bid No Bid $866.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $543.60 $330.00 No Bid No Bid $347.40 No Bid

12/cs. 100 Active Mat. Hospeco Continental NL-3000 ES-230-12 Big D Janico

Contains Quats - 30 cs.

29 MDS 20 in. STETCO Stripping Pads, Emerald No Bid No Bid $1,123.50 No Bid $1,841.25 $1,680.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,353.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

High Performance ACS #73-20 SSS ETC 3M

75 cs., NO SUBSTITUTIONS Hi Pro Diamond
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CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES

BID#16-010-BOE

Item Description M.D. Genesis II Pyramid Interboro Benman E-Z Way CCP W.B. Dumouchel Tronex K & S Unipak Rovic I-Ric Central N.E. All Calico

# Stetson Inc. School Packaging Industries Products Industries Mason Paper International Distrib. Poly Maint. Star

30 3M or Eq. Scrubbing Pads No Bid No Bid $335.70 No Bid $450.00 $445.80 No Bid $379.80 $448.50 No Bid $375.00 No Bid $907.50 No Bid No Bid $390.00 $408.30 No Bid

20 in. Blue - 30 cs. ACS #53-20 SSS ETC ACS5330 Americo BP20B 3M Norton Americo

Per Case S60200

31 3M 3600 Eraser Buff Pads No Bid $519.00 $559.50 No Bid $1,575.00 $842.00 No Bid $510.00 $1,517.50 No Bid $640.00 No Bid $1,737.50 No Bid No Bid $650.00 $694.00 No Bid

20 in.or Eq. Treleoni ACS #36.20 3M ETC ACS3620 3B-209-Eraser BP20P 3M Norton Americo

50 cs. Blue Jay

32 3M Red Speed Pads No Bid $519.00 $559.50 No Bid $750.00 $743.00 No Bid $510.00 $747.50 No Bid $625.00 No Bid $1,512.50 No Bid No Bid $650.00 $680.50 No Bid

20 in. or Eq. - 50 cs. Treleoni ACS #51-20 SSS ACS5120 Americo BP20R 3M Norton Americo

33 3M Scrubbing Sponges or No Bid $1,741.50 $824.25 No Bid $1,020.00 $1,893.75 No Bid $866.25 $1,012.50 No Bid $1,733.25 No Bid $3,204.75 $108.75 No Bid $1,875.00 $945.75 No Bid

Better, Scotch Brite Treleoni Hydra SSS Boardwalk 3B-74N 4 x 6 3M Norton Americo

6 1/4x3 1/2x5/8 - 75 cs. 20/cs.

34 Cellulose Sponges No Bid No Bid $66.72 No Bid $61.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid $79.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid $215.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid $89.76 $52.88

7 3/8x4x2x1/4 - Sample Hydra BI10 3B-C41 Hydra Americo Hydra

2 cs.

35 Rubbermaid Lobby Dust No Bid $259.20 $239.60 No Bid $328.00 $440.00 No Bid $240.00 $758.00 No Bid $260.00 No Bid $575.60 $280.00 No Bid No Bid $317.60 $305.60

Pan #2007 Genesis Rubbermaid Janico O'Cedar Continental RB-6374 JE2602 Rubbermaid Janico Continental

40 un.

36 Rubbermaid Lobby Dust No Bid $107.20 $199.60 No Bid $126.00 $216.00 No Bid $130.00 $302.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $282.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $126.00 $93.60

Brooms Genesis Rubbermaid SSS Next Step Continental RB-6374 Rubbermaid Janico ABCO

40 un.

37 Angled Brooms Upright No Bid $192.00 $199.50 No Bid $205.00 $180.50 No Bid $212.50 $382.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $353.00 $275.00 No Bid No Bid $199.00 $349.00

Flagged Polystyrene Genesis ABCO Continental IM-91526 Carlisle Janico Rubbermaid

50 un. 

38 Rubbermaid or Equal No Bid $1,165.20 $1,349.40 No Bid $1,626.00 $1,341.00 No Bid $1,035.00 $1,189.50 No Bid $1,335.00 No Bid $2,025.90 No Bid No Bid $1,170.00 $2,171.70 $1,108.20

Mop Bucket & Wringer Genesis Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Carlisle Continental Update RM7480-18YEL Rubbermaid Carlisle Janico Winco

Marked "Wet Floor"

26 qt, Plastic - 30 un.

39 Rubbermaid Plastic No Bid $25.40 $29.90 No Bid $25.00 $50.00 No Bid $33.75 $64.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $60.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.10 $25.70

Yellow #6112-Eng./Span. Genesis ABCO SSS Carlisle Continental RB-6112-77 Rubbermaid Janico Winco

Wet Floor Signs, 5 un.

40 3M 3600 Eraser Pads No Bid $688.20 $299.40 No Bid $2,098.50 $1,471.50 No Bid $1,804.50 $1,972.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,319.00 No Bid No Bid $960.00 $389.70 No Bid

27 in. 34x3 1/4x4 1/2 Treleoni ACS #36-27-2 3M Blue Jay 3M 3B-27-Eraser 3M Norton Americo

30 cs.

41 N. E. Maint. Depot Rough Fl. No Bid No Bid $2,626.80 No Bid $4,270.20 $819.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,517.80 No Bid No Bid $5,940.00 No Bid No Bid

Wet Mops - NO SUBS Golden Star SSS Maxi-Rough Hillyard

12/cs. - 55 cs. $4,314.75

42 Rubbermaid Waxed Paper No Bid $444.60 $1,438.80 No Bid $438.00 $592.50 No Bid $437.10 $869.70 No Bid $483.90 No Bid $547.20 $572.70 No Bid $11,880.00 $622.80 $356.40

Receptacle Liners #6140 Hospeco Rubbermaid HS6141 RM-Liner Hospeco RB-6141 RM6141-HOS Rubbermaid Hospital Hospeco

30 cs. Specialty

43 Champ Wipes Work Horse No Bid No Bid $25,490.00 No Bid $12,900.00 $9,030.00 $13,647.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21,108.60 No Bid $14,859.00

Wipes, Pop Up #8688 The Champ Champs 9 x 17 No Bid No Bid MD-86011 Hillyard No Bid No Bid MDI No Bid

NO SUBS- 300 cs. 540 cs. #86884
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CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES

BID#16-010-BOE

Item Description M.D. Genesis II Pyramid Interboro Benman E-Z Way CCP W.B. Dumouchel Tronex K & S Unipak Rovic I-Ric Central N.E. All Calico

# Stetson Inc. School Packaging Industries Products Industries Mason Paper International Distrib. Poly Maint. Star

44 First Aid Kits, Indoor No Bid No Bid $113.85 No Bid $61.50 No Bid $49.50 $33.99 $41.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $126.66 $90.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

For Up To 25 People Impact Health ACME SZ-K-FAK-25 Impact

3 kits Gards

45 North Safety Products No Bid No Bid $87.90 No Bid $82.60 No Bid $81.25 $78.80 $90.00 No Bid $32.00 No Bid $79.10 $80.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.40

Disp. Non-Toxic #7140N95 Impact 3M Pro Works MINON27375Z SZ-RS900-N95 MS17 Impact Safety

Dust Masks - 10 bx. Zone

46 Cloth Duct Tape 2" x 60 yds. No Bid No Bid $19.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.70 $25.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 in Core - 5 rolls #TPP64613

47 Unger Brute Scraper No Bid No Bid $64.50 No Bid $366.00 No Bid No Bid $225.90 $389.70 No Bid $333.00 No Bid $523.80 $439.50 No Bid No Bid $446.70 No Bid

30 un. Unger Unger Continental UG-SH25C ET57110 Unger SH25C

48 NCL Rely Foaming Disinfectant Cleaner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $918.00 $943.50 No Bid No Bid $1,020.00 No Bid $862.20 No Bid $1,576.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 oz. Bottles Rely NL-95524 BK2003 Hillyard

NO SUBSTITUTIONS - 30 cs.

49 Fort James 9" Jumbo Bath No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,147.50 $1,979.25 No Bid $776.90 $1,626.25 No Bid $1,581.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,904.00 No Bid

Tissue Disp. #58250 JAPP12 Heavenly UP-JTPD TT1125DD Janico

85 un. Soft

50 Triple SSS Foam Disinfect. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,001.40 $2,987.75 No Bid No Bid $3,230.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,576.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cleaner - 12/cs. - 95 cs. SSS NCL NL-95524 Hillyard

NO SUBS

51 Triple SSS D C Plus Foam No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,397.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,627.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Disp. Cleaner NO SUBS SSS Hillyard

60 cs.

52 Twister Stone Care No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,092.80 $1,328.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,157.60 No Bid $857.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Grout Cleaner 4 gal./cs. Twister BK2517-4 Hillyard

20 cs.

53 Split Non-Detergent Restroom Cleaner No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,024.00 No Bid No Bid $290.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $591.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 gal. per case - 8 cs. CS-Bath Hillyard

54 Seco High Duster No Bid No Bid $197.55 No Bid $1,102.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $364.05 No Bid No Bid No Bid $497.25 $220.95 No Bid No Bid $221.85 No Bid

Extension Duster or Equal Impact T-120 UNS-9442 Hillyard Janico

45 un.

55 Probe Back Pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,208.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $142.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vacuum Bags EPT90557

20 cs.

56 X-Treme Gym Kote Wood Finish Water Based Urethane No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,075.00 $8,281.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9,715.50 No Bid No Bid $8,000.00 No Bid No Bid

5 gal. Pail SSS NCL Hillyard

NO SUBSTITUTIONS - 25 Pails Endura

57 X-Treme Maintainer, 4 gal./cs. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $338.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $496.96 No Bid No Bid $432.00 No Bid No Bid

Citrus Finish Restorer, 8 Cases, NO SUBSTITUTIONS NCL Hillyard

58 X-Treme Blue Floor Cleaner, 4 gal./cs. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $380.80 $372.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $322.88 No Bid No Bid $384.00 No Bid No Bid

8 Cases, NO SUBSTITUTIONS SSS Pivot Int. Hillyard

59 Eco-G Floor Finish, Green Seal, 5 gal./cs. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,664.00 No Bid No Bid $63.65/pail No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,638.80 No Bid No Bid $3,360.00 No Bid No Bid

40 Cases, NO SUBSTITUTIONS NCL Simoniz Hillyard

60 Stainless Steel Clean & No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,941.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,666.40 $2,049.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Polish Towels 40/Container SSS Hillyard

60 cs.
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61 Smart San Healthcare Pers. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,526.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Hand Wash - Unscent. SMA 0026LL Hillyard

SMA0019 - 40 cs. Non-alcohol

62 18 in. Gym Floor Sanding No Bid $469.40 $309.90 No Bid $816.00 $431.00 No Bid No Bid $385.00 No Bid $378.90 No Bid $663.60 $699.30 No Bid No Bid $409.10 $360.80

Screens 80 Grit Treleoni ACS #32143 3M AM-508018 BP18SS-80 Hillyard Americo Americo

10 bxs.

63 18 in. Gym Floor Sanding No Bid $446.20 $284.50 No Bid $672.00 $356.00 No Bid No Bid $345.00 No Bid $339.90 No Bid $507.16 $282.00 No Bid No Bid $366.90 No Bid

Screens 100 Grit Treleoni ACS #32006 3M AM-501018 BP18SS-100 Hillyard Americo

10 bxs.

64 18 in. Gym Floor Sanding No Bid $159.24 $103.92 No Bid $232.80 $133.80 No Bid No Bid $128.00 No Bid $123.24 No Bid $180.96 $216.80 No Bid No Bid $133.04 No Bid

Screens 120 Grit Treleoni ACS #32104 3M AM-501218 BP18SS-120 Hillyard Americo

4 bxs.

65 18 in. Gym Floor Sanding No Bid $196.96 $147.96 No Bid $394.56 $210.00 No Bid No Bid $196.00 No Bid $184.72 No Bid $320.64 $337.80 No Bid No Bid $199.40 No Bid

Screens 60 Grit Treleoni ACS #32092 3M AM-506018 BP18SS-60 Hillyard Americo

4 bxs.

66 Triple SSS Back Pack Vacs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,456.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,061.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Speed Star 1000 SSS Mercury Tennant

6 un., NO SUBS

67 Triple SSS Filter Bags No Bid $2,493.60 No Bid No Bid $8,760.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,171.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.50/pack No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Speedstar 1000 GK-Everest SSS Jan-PTEU-2 $7,000.00

40 cs. ?

68 Flexi Sheen Wax No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $244.40 $275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $240.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Conditioner 4 gal/cs. Flexi Sheen BK2612-4

5 cs.

69 Flexi Clean Rubber Floor No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $198.00 $225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $193.60 No Bid No Bid $325.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cleaner 4 gal./cs Flexi Clean BK2610-4

5 cs.

70 WD40 - 802 Cans No Bid No Bid $235.92 No Bid $204.80 No Bid No Bid $173.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 cs. WDC110054

71 Clorox Tilex Mildew Rem. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $996.00 $1,260.00 $1,305.00 $968.70 $1,117.50 No Bid $1,119.60 No Bid $1,029.00 $1,260.00 No Bid No Bid $1,265.40 No Bid

9 qt. Spray Bottles/cs. Tilex NCL Clorox Clorox CL-35600 BK35600 Clorox

30 cs., NO SUBS Trigger

72 Rubbermaid Tilt Trucks No Bid No Bid $505.95 No Bid $420.00 $460.90 No Bid $330.16 $425.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $514.22 $432.14

56 3/4"L x 28"W x 38 5/8"H Rubbermaid 9T17 Continental RB-9T17 Rubbermaid

#9T17 - 1 un.

73 Rubbermaid Site Safety No Bid No Bid $101.88 No Bid $121.50 $131.70 No Bid No Bid $133.50 No Bid $133.02 No Bid $129.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid $56.70 $107.64

Hanging Signs #9S15 Rubbermaid 9S15 RB-9S15 RM9S15 Rubbermaid Janico Rubbermaid

6 un.

74 Unger Rubber Gloves, Window Washing No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $196.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $240.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.36 $291.15 No Bid No Bid $236.64 No Bid

Ung. Gloves Unger UG-G10V2 Impact GLOV2

8 prs. UG-G10V4

75 Rubbermaid Brute Dolly No Bid No Bid $539.40 No Bid $722.40 $782.60 No Bid $216.00 $226.80 No Bid $725.52 No Bid $440.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid $298.68 $227.76

RCP 2840-43 Rubbermaid Continental Update RM2640-43BLA Rubbermaid Janico Continental

12 un.
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CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES

BID#16-010-BOE

Item Description M.D. Genesis II Pyramid Interboro Benman E-Z Way CCP W.B. Dumouchel Tronex K & S Unipak Rovic I-Ric Central N.E. All Calico

# Stetson Inc. School Packaging Industries Products Industries Mason Paper International Distrib. Poly Maint. Star

76 M.D. Stetson HYDSP 4912 No Charge No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Charge No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Wall Mount Dispenser w/purchase

NO SUBS - 12 un. 76, 77 & 92

77 M.D. Stetson PC 101 Neutral $9,999.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,181.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Glass Cleaner Green Seal Hillyard

4/cs. NO SUBS - 75 cs.

78 M.D. Stetson PC 103 Disinf. $5,555.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,482.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

256 HBV - 4/cs. NO SUBS Hillyard

50 cs.

79 Rubbermaid Trolleys Pt. No Bid No Bid $311.70 No Bid $359.40 $389.10 No Bid $231.00 No Bid No Bid $402.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $869.28 $319.68

#3551-88 Rubbermaid Continental RM3551-88 Rubbermaid

6 un.

80 Core Products Hydroxi Pro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,560.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $803.20 No Bid

Cleaning Wipes - 35 Wipes HPCW 35 HPCW-35

per Tub 7x9 - 6/cs. 20 cs. TUBS

81 Triple SSS Multi Purpose No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $642.50 No Bid $944.00 No Bid $1,137.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cleaning Wipes - 75 Wipes Green Seal Monk Wipes DW-PSWC Saniwipe

per Tub 8x12 - 6/cs 25 cs.

82 Triple SSS Nex Gen Micro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,009.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $993.00 No Bid No Bid $1,637.64 No Bid

Fiber Carpet Bonnets 21 in. ASP21M Americo

Reversible 6/cs. 12 cs.

83 Triple SSS Micro Fiber No Bid $576.00 No Bid No Bid $787.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,175.20 $1,248.00 No Bid No Bid $96.48 $3,198.80

Looped End Dust Mop Pads Genesis #37144 Filmop Janico Rubbermaid

24" Slant Slip Blue - 20 cs.

84 Triple SSS High Duster No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $342.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $109.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $847.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $263.00 No Bid

Sleeves #89036/89037/ #37148 NF-Dustkit Hillyard Janico

89038 10 of each - 10 cs.

85 Triple SSS Nex Gen Micro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,141.60 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid $2,563.20 No Bid $2,823.60 No Bid $3,750.00 $1,248.00 No Bid No Bid $2,743.20 No Bid

Fiber Gen. Purp. Cleaning Green #37311 16 x 16 NFCL16 MECS-004GN Filmop ACA 

Wipes #89028 250/cs. -20 cs. GREA 16 x 16 16 x 16 Microfiber

86 Triple SSS Nex Gen Micro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,141.60 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid $2,563.20 No Bid $2,823.60 No Bid No Bid $9.51/pair No Bid No Bid $2,743.20 No Bid

Fiber Gen. Purp. Cleaning Blue #37310 16 x 16 NFCL16 MECS-002BL ? ACA 

Wipes #89031 250/cs.-20 cs. BUEA 16 x 16 Microfiber

87 Triple SSS Nex Gen Micro No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,570.80 $2,500.00 No Bid No Bid $1,281.50 No Bid $1,411.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,371.60 No Bid

Fiber Gen. Purp. Cleaning 16 x 16 NFCL16 MECS-003RN ACA 

Wipes #89034 250/cs.-10 cs. PUCEA 16 x 16 Microfiber

88 Triple SSS Micro Fiber No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $59.76 No Bid

Gloves #89040 Detail Gloves Janico

12/cs. 2 cs.

89 Rubbermaid Regular Trash No Bid No Bid $155.60 No Bid $3,600.00 $254.00 No Bid $520.00 $1,480.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $220.00 $488.00 $5,177.60

#2958 or Equal Rubbermaid RM3958 Continental RB-2958 Carlisle Rubbermaid Rubbermaid

40 un.

90 Rubbermaid Recycling Cont. No Bid No Bid $239.80 No Bid $187.00 $202.40 No Bid $124.00 $205.00 No Bid $209.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $359.10 $190.16

#3536-06 Rubbermaid Continental RB-3536WHI RM3536-73BLU Rubbermaid

4 un.
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CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES

BID#16-010-BOE

Item Description M.D. Genesis II Pyramid Interboro Benman E-Z Way CCP W.B. Dumouchel Tronex K & S Unipak Rovic I-Ric Central N.E. All Calico

# Stetson Inc. School Packaging Industries Products Industries Mason Paper International Distrib. Poly Maint. Star

91 Rubbermaid Mobile Fence No Bid No Bid $799.96 No Bid $776.00 $841.44 No Bid No Bid Discontinued No Bid $730.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $789.88

#9513 Rubbermaid RM 9S11 Item RM9S1Y Rubbermaid

2 un.

92 M.D. Stetson PC 120 - Multi $11,998.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8,550.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,115.50 No Bid

SurfaceCleaner Green Seal Stride Hillyard Brulin

4/cs - NO SUBS, 90 cs. Green Seal Hyppermax

93 Nexstep #96072 24" x 5" No Bid $640.80 $598.80 No Bid $740.40 $928.00 No Bid $868.80 $105.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,242.00 $781.20 No Bid No Bid $1,982.40 No Bid

Washable Microfiber Dust Greenwood ABW SSS Wilen NFDM24RDEA Hillyard ACA

Blue 12/cs., 10 cs. M850024B MFDM 24NV

94 Nexstep #96074 36" x 5" No Bid $745.20 $298.80 No Bid $472.80 $636.50 No Bid $1,176.00 $135.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $805.80 $522.00 No Bid No Bid $2,287.20 No Bid

Washable Microfiber Dust Greenwood ABW SSS Wilen NFDM36GREA Hillyard ACA

Mops 6/cs., 10 cs. M850036B MFDM 36NV

95 Nexstep #96076 48" x 5" No Bid $1,024.60 $358.80 No Bid $528.60 $778.00 No Bid $1,602.00 $165.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,006.80 $423.60 No Bid No Bid $2,592.00 No Bid

Washable Microfiber Dust Greenwood ABW SSS COCPC090048 NFDM8YLEA Hillyard ACA

Mops 6/cs., 10 cs. M850048B MFDM 48NV

96 Nexstep #96078 60" x 5" No Bid $1,620.00 $479.40 No Bid $742.80 $964.30 No Bid No Bid $199.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,470.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,201.60 No Bid

Washable Microfiber Dust Carolina Mop ABW SSS NFDM60BLEA Hillyard ACA

 Mops 6/cs., 10 cs. M850060B MFDM 60NV

97 KC16N Blue Microfiber No Bid No Bid $207.00 No Bid $221.76 $300.00 $137.50 No Bid $255.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $225.00 No Bid No Bid $405.00 $273.00 No Bid

Towels 16 x 16 270 gsm Impact SSS 16 x 16 Microworks NFCL16BLCA Filmop Janico

50/pk 6 cs.

98 KC16R Blue Microfiber No Bid No Bid $207.00 No Bid $221.76 $300.00 $137.50 No Bid $300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $225.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $273.00 No Bid

Towels 16 x 16 270 gsm Impact SSS Microworks NFCL61BUEA Filmop Janico

50/pk 6 cs.

99 Smart San Pop Up Wipes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $970.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $230.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $454.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

160 Containers, 6/cs., 10 cs. SMA W006 NT-69080 Saniwipe

100 Sani Cloth HP Wipes 6/cs. No Bid No Bid $479.80 No Bid $416.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $489.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $454.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 cs. Sanicloth P22884 NT-Z-P97584 Saniwipe

101 Triple SSS Multi Surface No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $207.50 No Bid No Bid $101.20 $115.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $227.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Cleaning Wipes, 6 Tubs/cs., SSS NT-69080 Saniwipe

5 cs.

102 M.D. Stetson Prozime #121 $14,788.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12,966.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

NO SUBS 160 cases Hillyard

103 M.D. Stetson #108 Spray $40,246.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,276.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

& Wipe - NO SUBS 160 cases Hillyard
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