WESTPORT PUBLIC SCHOOLS
110 MYRTLE AVENUE
WESTPORT, CONNECTICUT 06880
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Telephone (203) 341-1001 ELIC LONGO, JR., MBA
Facsimile (203) 341-1008 Director of Schools Business Operations

E-mail address: elongo@westport.k12.ct.us

February 24, 2015

Mr. Dean Ratick, President

Ratick Combustion, Inc.

PO Box 6406

Bridgeport, CT 06606

Ref:  15-008-BOE Boiler Cleaning and Service
Dear Mr. Ratick:

This is to advise that your firm has been awarded Bid 15-008-BOE for Boiler Cleaning and
Service at Westport Public Schools as required in our bid specifications.

A purchase order will be mailed out shortly. Please do not send out any material or equipment
until you receive a purchase order.

Yours fruly,

Elio Lonhgd, Jr., MBA
Director of School Business Operations

Cc: T.Hunyadi



‘ BOILER CLEANING AND SERVICE - ALL SCHOOLS
" BID #15-008-BOE

JULY 1, 2015 - JUNE 30, 2016

School Ratick Combustion, Inc] Funk Boiler Works Turnpike Furnace
Coleytown Elementary School $1,860.00 $4,750.00 $1,900.00
Coleytown Middle School $1,960.00 No Bid $1,900.00
Kings Highway Elementary Schog $1,280.00 $3,800.00 $1,300.00
Long Lots Elementary School $1,475.00 No Bid $1,500,00
Staples High School $3,000.00 $13,300.00 $4,000.00
Green's Farms Elementary Schod $1,760.00 $15,200.00 $1,900.00
Bedford Middle School $3,125.00 No Bid $3,100.00
Saugatuck Elementary School $1,280.00 No Bid $1,300.00
TOTAL $15,740.00 $37,050.00 $16,900.00

JULY 1, 2016 - JUNE 30, 2017

Schoot Ratick Combustion, Inc] Funk Boiler Works Turnpike Furnace
Coleytown Elementary School $1,860.00 $4,750.00 $1,900.00
Coleytown Middle School $1,960.00 No Bid $1,900.00
Kings Highway Elementary Schoqg $1,280.00 $3,800.00 $1,300.00
Long Lots Elementary School $1,475.00 No Bid $1,500.00
Staples High School $3,000.00 $13,300.00 $4,000.00
Green's Farms Elementary Schog $1,760.00 $15,200.00 $1,900.00
Bedford Middte School $3,125.00 No Bid $3,100.00
Saugatuck Elementary School $1,280.00 No Bid $1,300.00
TOTAL $15,740.00 $37,050.00 $16,900.00

JULY 1, 2017 - JUNE 30, 2018

School IRatick Combustion, Inc] Funk Boiler Works Turnpike Furnace
Coleytown Elementary Scheol $1,860.00 $4,750.00 $1,900.00
Coleytown Middle School $1,960.00 No Bid $1,900.00
Kings Highway Elementary Schog $1,280.00 $3,800.00 $1,300.00
Long Lots Elementary School $1,475.00 No Bid $1,500.00
Staples High School $3,000.00 $13,300.00 $4,000.00
Green's Farms Elementary Schod $1,760.00 $15,200.00 $1,900.00
Bedford Middle School $3,125.00 No Bid $3,100.00
Saugatuck Elementary School $1,280.00 No Bid $1,300.00
TOTAL $15,740.00 $37,050.00 $16,900.00
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